BRIGHTON & HOVE CITY COUNCIL
ROAD TRAFFIC REGULATION ACT 1984

BRIGHTON & HOVE (WAITING & LOADING/UNLOADING
RESTRICTIONS AND PARKING PLACES) CONSOLIDATION ORDER 2008
AMENDMENT ORDER No.9 201 §

Brighton & Hove City Council in exercise of its powers under Sections 1, 2, 3, 4, 19, 32,
35, 35A, 43, 44, 45, 46, 46A, 47,49, 51, 53, 55, 61, 63, 63A, 66, [17 and 124 (1) (c) & (d)
to the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 (“the 1984 Act”) as amended and Part 6 of the
Traffic Management Act 2004 and of all other enabling powers after consultation with the
Chief Officer of Police in accordance with Part lil of Schedule 9 to thel 984 Act hereby
makes the above named Order.

The provisions of this Order will come into operation on the ﬁﬁay of l\‘OVEJVlBéE’_ 2011
and amend the Brighton & Hove (Waiting & Loading/Unloading Restrictions and Parking
Places) Consolidation Order 2008, as amended, as follows:

ARTICLE AMENDMENTS:
PART 10 - INDEX OF SCHEDULE |
Part 11 Loading Bays

After existing Part | 1.8 add a new Part to the Index as follows:
1.9 | Monday to Saturday éam to épm

SCHEDULE | AMENDMENTS:
Part I.I No Waiting At Any Time
Amend item 213 Bishops Road: delete “Both sides” and substitute "West side”

Add new item 213a: Bishops Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of The
Droveway northwards for a distance of 17.5 metres

Add new item 237a: Brading Road — East side — From the southern kerbline of
Hartington Road southwards for a distance of 7.5 metres

Add new item 28%a: Buttercup Walk — North side — From the eastern kerbline of Old
Boat Walk eastwards for a distance of 7 metres

Add new item 289b: Buttercup Walk — North, East and South sides — From the eastern
boundary wall of No.I Buttercup Walk eastwards, northward then westwards for a
distance of 54 metres to cover turning area.

Add new item 289c: Buttercup Walk — North, West and South sides — From a point 4
metres west of the boundary wall between Nos. 10 & 12 Buttercup Walk westwards,
southwards then eastwards for a distance of 55.3 metres to cover turning area.



Add new item 289d: Buttercup Wallk — North side — From the western kerbline of Old
Boat Walk westwards for a distance of |2 metres.

Add new item 322b: Carden Avenue (Service Road to Shops) — South side — From the
western kerbline of County Oak Avenue westwards for a distance of 7 metres.

Amend item 367a Challoners Close: delete “5 metres” and substitute “7 metres”

Add new item 409: Cliff Approach — Both side — From the southern kerbline of Roedean
Road southwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 410: Ciiff Approach — East side ~ From the northern kerbliine of The Cliff
northwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 41 1: Cliff Approach — East side ~ From the southern kerbline of The CIiff
southwards for a distance of b metras

Add new item 412: Cliff Approach — West side — From the northern kerbline of Cliff
Road northwards for a distance of 8 metres

Add new item 413: Cliff Road — Both sides — From the western kerbline of Cliff
Approach westwards for a distance of 8 metres

Add new item 4!3a: Clovers End — East side — From the northern kerbline of Old Boat
Wall northwards for a distance of 12.7 metres

Add new item 41 3b: Clovers End — Woest side — From the northern kerbline of Old Boat
Walk northwards for a distance of 1.2 metres

Add new item 413c: Clovers End — West, North and East sides — From a point 3.6
metres north of the northern boundary wall of No.4 Clovers End northwards, eastwards
then southwards for a distance of 54.7 metres to cover turning area.

Add new item 444d: County Oak Avenue — West side — From the southern kerbline of
Carden Avenue (Service Road to Shops) southwards for a distance of |6 metres

Add new item 464a: Crescent Drive South — South side- From the western kerbline of
Shipley Road westwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 464b: Crescent Drive South — South side — From the eastern kerbline of
Shipley Road eastwards for a distance of 2.5 metres

Add new item 51 la: Curwen Place — South side — From the eastern kerbline of the
access road between Beechwood Flats and Pinewood Flats eastwards for a distance of 2
metres

Add new item 51 Ib: Curwen Place - South side — From the western kerbline of the
access road between Beechwood Flats and Pinewood Flats westwards for a distance of 2
metres

4]



Add new item 51 lc: Curwen Place — South side — From the eastern kerbline of the
access road between Pinewood Flats and Cedarwood Flats eastwards for a distance of 2
metres

Add new item 51 1d: Curwen Place — South side — From the western kerbline of the
access road between Pinewood Flats and Cedarwood Flats westwards for a distance of 2
metres

Amend item 629 Drove Road, Portslade: delete “a point |5 metres east of the eastern”
and substitute “the western *

Delete item 632: Drove Road, Portslade

Add new item 632 Drove Road, Portslade: From the eastern kerbline of Southdown
Road eastwards to the western kerbline of the access road to Peter Galdwin County
Primary School.

Add new item 632a: Drove Road, Portslade — South side ~ From the prolongation of the
eastern kerbline of Southdown Road eastwards to the western kerbline of Manor Road

Renumber existing item 632a Dudley Road as item 632b
Amend item 638a Dyke Road: delete “38 metres” and substitute “36 metres”

Add new item 853a: Foredown Road — North side — From the eastern kerbline of Village
Close eastwards for a distance of 40 metres

Delete item 854; Foredown Road

Add new item 854: Foredown Road — South side — From the eastern kerbline of Manor
Road northwards to the western kerbline of the Slip Road to No.s [0 — 40 Foredown
Road

Add new item 10|2a: Gordon Road, Portsiade — West side — From the northern kerbline
of Symbister Road northwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 1022b: Graham Close — East and South side — From the southern
boundary wall of No.8 Graham Close southwards then westwards to the eastern
boundary wall of No.14 Graham Close

Add new item | 156a: Hartington Road — South side — From the eastern kerbline of
Brading Road eastwards for a distance of 9 metres

Amend item [222b Hillcrest: delete “[0 metres” and substitute * 15 metres”

Add new item 1222c: Hill Drive — North side — From the eastern kerbline of Woodland
Parade eastwards for a distance of 20 metres

Add new item 1223a: Hillside — South side — From the eastern kerbline of The Avenue
eastwards for a distance of 8 metres

Amend item 1310 Hove Park Way: delete “both sides™ and substitute “West side”



Add new item 1310a: Hove Park Way — East side — From the northern kerbline of The
Droveway northwards for a distance of 18.4 metres

Amend item 1367 Jesmond Road: delete “7 metres” and substitute "8 metres”
Amend item 1415a Kipling Avenue: delete “southern”

Add new item |558a: Madehurst Close — North side — From the eastern kerbline of
Whitehawk Hill Road eastwards for a distance of 24.5 metres.

Add new item 1558b: Madehurst Close — South side — From the eastern kerbline of
Whitehawlk Hill Road eastwards for a distance of 30.5 metres.

Renumber existing item 1616a Marlow Road as item |614f
Renumber existing item |616b Marlow Road as item 1614g
Amend item 1634 Melbourne Street: delete: * Northern Carriageway” and substitute
“(Northern arm) From the eastern kerbline of Lewes Road eastwards to the western

kerbline of the eastern arm of Melbourne Street”

Amend item 1634a Melbourne Street: insert “(Northern arm)” in front of “From the
eastern kerbline”

Add new item 1666a: Mile Oak Gardens — South side — From the eastern kerbline of
Ridgeway eastwards for a distance of 7 metres

Amend item 1671 Mile Qak Road: delete *60.5 metres” and substitute “80.5 metres”
Amend itemn 1883 Oakdene Crescent: delete “both sides’ and substitute “north side”

Add new item 1883a: Qakdene Crescent — South side - South arm - From the western
kerbline of Mile Oak Road west for |13 metres

Amend item 1891 Old Boat Wallk: delete “for 23.5 metres” and substitute “and
southwards to the northern kerbline of Buttercup Walk”

Delete item {892: Old Boat Walk

Add new item 1892: Old Boat Walk — North side — From the western kerbline of
Clovers End westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Add new item 1892a: Old Boat Walk — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Buttercup Walk northwards for a distance of 9 metres

Renumber existing item 1892a Old Court Close as item |892b

Renumber existing item 1892b Old Court Close as item 1892¢



Add new item 2000a: Patchdean — South and West side (Southern Arm) — From the
prolongation of the eastern kerbline of the access road to garages westwards then
northwards for a distance of 24.5 metres

Add new item 2000b: Patchdean — North and East side (Southern Arm) — From the
western kerbline of the access road to garages westwards then northwards for a distance
of 12 metres

Amend item 2005a Peel Road: delete “for a distance of |10 metres” and substitute “to the
northern boundary wall of No.25 Peel Road™.

Amend item 2037 Portland Road: delete “10 metres east” and substitute “the eastern
kerbline"” delete 10 metres west” and substitute “the western kerbline”

Delete item 2036: Portland Road

Add new item 2036: Portland Road —~ South side — From the western kerbline of
Rothbury Road westwards for a distance of [5.5 metres

Delete item 2038: Portland Road
Delete item 2039: Portland Road

Add new item 2039: Portland Road — South side — From the eastern kerbline of Jesmond
Road eastwards for a distance of 7.3 metres

Delete item 2040: Portland Road
Delete item 2096: Preston Park (The Approach Road to), Brighton

Amend item 2174 Richmond Parade: delete *“VWhole Description” and substitute “South
side - From the western kerbline of Sussex Place westwards for a distance of 6.1 metres’

Add new item 2174a: Richmond Parade — South side — From the eastern kerbline of
Sussex Place eastwards for a distance of 5 metres

Amend item 2|75 Richmond Parade: delete *12.2 metres” and substitute “15 metres”
and delete “9.]1 metres” and substitute “10,3 metres”

Add new item 2!78a: Richmond Parade — South side — From the western kerbline of
Ashton Rise westwards for a distance of || metres

Add new item 2178b: Richmond Parade — North side — From the eastern kerbline of
Albion Street eastwards for a distance of 8.7 metres

Add new item 2178c: Richmond Parade — North side — From a point 26.2 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Albion Street eastwards for a distance of 2.5 metres

Add new item 2205: Roedean Crescent ~ both sides — From the northern kerbline of
Roedean Road northwards for a distance of 5 metres



Amend item 2206 Roedean Road: delete the whole description and substitute “ North
side — From the eastern kerbline of Wilson Avenue to a point 5 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Roedean Crescent

Amend item 22| | Roedean Road: delete the whole description and substitute “South
side — From the eastern kerbline of Marina Way eastwards to a point 18 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of The CIiff

Add new item 2417a: Shipley Road — Both sides — From the southern kerbline of
Crescent Drive South southwards for a distance of |4 metres

Amend item 2471 Springfield Road: delete “13.7 metres” and substitute “22 metres”

Add new item 2474: Springfield Road — North side — From the eastern kerbline of
Beaconsfield Road eastwards for a distance of 22 metres.

Delete item 2476: Springifield Road

Add new item 2476: Springfield Road — South side — From the western kerbline of
Beaconsfield Road westwards for a distance of 4.5 metres.

Add new item 2476a: Springfield Road — South side — From the eastern kerbline of
Beaconsfield Road eastwards for a distance of 29 metres.

Add new item 2543a: Station Road, Brighton — West side — From the southern kerbline
of Clermont Road northwards for a distance of 7.4 metres

Delete item 2569a: Storrington Close, Hove

Add new item 2569a: Storrington Close — East side — From the northern kerbline of
Sunninghill Avenue northwards for a distance of 36 metres

Add new item 2585a: Sussex Place — East side — From the southern kerbline of Richmond
Parade southwards for a distance of 6 metres

Add new item 2606a: Symbister Road — North side — From the western kerbline of
Gordon Road westwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 2635a: The Avenue — East side — From the southern kerbline of Hillside
southwards for a distance of 8 metres

Add new item 2637a: The Cliff — Both sides — From the southern kerbline of Roedean
Road southwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 2637b: The Cliff — Both sides — From the eastern kerbline of CIiff
Approach eastwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 2637c: The Cliff — East side — From a point 25.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Roedean Road southwards for a distance of |2 metres



Add new item 2637d: The Cliff — West side — From point 23.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Roedean Road southwards for a distance of |3 metres.

Amend item 2670 The Droveway: delete “both sides” and substitute “South side”

Add new item 2670a: The Droveway — North side — From the western kerbline of
Bishops Road westwards for a distance of |0 metres

Add new item 2670b: The Droveway — North side — From the eastern kerbline of
Bishops Road eastwards for a distance of 15 metres

Amend item 2955a Westdene Drive: delete 10 metres” and substitute *“| 5 metres”
Amend item 2955b Westdene Drive: delete *“10 metres” and substitute “|5 metras”

Add new item 298%a: Whitehawk Close — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Whitehawlc Crescent northwards for a distance of 14 metres

Add new item 2997: Whitehawk Crescent — North side — From the western kerbline of
Whitehawk Close westwards for a distance of 12 metres

Part 1.4 No Waiting Monday to Saturday 8.00 am to 6.00 pm
Renumber existing item 40 Olive Road as item 49

Delete item 63: Upper Lewes Road, Brighton
Delete item 64: Upper Lewes Road, Brighton

Part 1.13 No Waiting Monday to Friday 9.00am to épm
Renumber existing item 1a Cranleigh Avenue as item 3

Part 2.1 No Waiting or Loading at any time
Renumber existing item 8c The Green, Rottingdean as item 8e

Add new item 8c: Station Road, Brighton — West side — From the southern kerbline of
Clermont Road northwards for a distance of 17.4 metres

Renumber existing item 8e The Highway as item 8f

Part 5.3 Limited waiting for 30 minutes (no return within | hour) Monday to
Saturday 9am to épm
Delete item 3: Warren Way, Brighton

Part 5.5 Limited waiting for | hour (no return within | hour) Monday to

Saturday 8am to 6pm
Amend item 20a Victoria Road: delete 24 metres” and substitute “22.2 metres”

Amend item 20b Victoria Road: delete “47 metres” and substitute “44.7 metres” and
delete “25 metres” and substitute “24.6 metres”



Part 5.7 Limited waiting for | hour (no return within | hour) Monday to
Saturday 9am to 6pm
Amend item 18 Warren Way: delete “38.5 metres” and substitute “42 metres”

Add new item 18a: Warren Way — South side — From a point 26.3 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Falmer Road eastwards for a distance of 8.5 metres

Part 5.8 Limited waiting for | hour (no return within 2 hours) Monday to
Saturday 9am to épm
Delete item |13: Park Crescent, Rottingdean

Delete item 3a: Park Crescent, Rottingdean

Part 5.13 Limited waiting for 2 hours (no return within 3 hour) Monday to
Saturday 9am to épm

Add new item |: Beaconsfield Road — East side - From a point 46.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Florence Road southwards for a distance of 16.6 metres

Add new item 2: Beaconsfield Road — East side - From a point 74.6 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Florence Road southwards for a distance of 18.5 metres

Add new item 3: Beaconsfield Road — East side - From a point 44.7 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Springfield Road southwards for a distance of 2.7 metres

Part 5.17 Limited waiting for 3 hours (no return within | hour) Monday to
Saturday 9am to épm

Add new item 4: Woodland Drive — East side — From a point 9 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Shirley Drive northwards for a distance of 38.4 metres

Part 6.1 Disabled Parking Bay At Any Time

Add new item 13b: Ashton Rise — West side — From a point 2] metres south of the
western kerbline of Richmond Parade southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside
Ebenezer Apartments)

Add new item 14b; Auckland Drive — North side — From a point 14 metres east of the
boundary wall between 19/21 Auckland Drive eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(outside No.23)

Delete item 18: Barnett Road, Brighton (outside No.59)

Add new item 22: Batemans Road — East side — From a point 124 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Crescent Drive South northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(outside No.19)

Delete item 34: Beatty Avenue, Brighton (outside No.64)

Add new item 60b: Buller Road — West side — From a point 35 metres south of the

southern kerbline of Natal Road southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside Nos.
59/61)



Delete item 68b: Carden Hill, Brighton {outside No.55)

Delete item 69: Carlyle Street, Brighton (outside No.65)

Delete item 79: Chrisdory Road, Portslade {outside No.14)

Delete item 79a: Church Street, Portslade

Add new item 88: Coolham Drive — West side — From a point 14 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Limney Road southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside
No.4)

Delete item[22c: Dean Gardens, Portslade (outside No.29)

Add new item [25c: Dene Vale — South side — From a point 8 metres east of the
boundary wall between 27/29 Dene Vale eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside
No.25)

Delete item 144b: Ditchling Gardens, Brighton (outside No.12)

Delete item [45: Ditchling Rise, Brighton (outside No.3)

Delete item 146: Ditchling Rise, Brighton (outside No.26)

Delete item 148: Ditchling Rise, Brighton (outside No.127)

Add new item |154e: Ditchling Road ~ East side — From a point 27 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Hollingdean Lane northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside

No.[44)
Delete item [63: Down Terrace, Brighton (outside No.57)

Add new item [64c: Drove Crescent — East side ~ From a point 30 metres south of the
boundary wall between Nos. 81 & 83 Drove Crescent southwards for a distance of 5.5
metres (outside No.71)

Delete item 207a: Florence Road, Brighton (outside No.69)

Add new item 207a: Florence Road — South side — From a point |7 metres west of the
western kerbline of Southdown Avenue westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside
No.46)

Delete item 208: Foredown Drive, Portslade (outside No.25)

Add new item 218a: Freshfield Street — South side — From a point 33 metres west of the
western kerbline of Queens Park Rise westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Delete item 238a: Goodwood Way, Brighton (outside No.|2)

Add new item 250f: Greenfield Crescent — North side — From a point 85 metres east of



the eastern kerbline of Braybon Avenue eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside
No.19)

Delete item 260: Hallyburton Road, Hove (outside No.90)

Add new item 261: Hangleton Close — North side — From a point 14 metres east of the
boundary wall between Nos. 26 & 27 Hangleton Close eastwards for a distance of 5.5
metres (outside No.25)

Delete itern 3 |8a: Holmes Avenue, Hove (outside No.93)

Delete item 323: Hutton Road, Brighton (rear of No.86 Burstead Close)

Delete item 32%9a: Hythe Road, Brighton (outside No.16)

Delete item 339: Jesmond Road, Hove {outside No.|7)

Add new item 358¢: Ladysmith Road — North side — From a point 21 metres east of the
boundary wall between Nos. 35 & 37 Ladysmith Road eastwards for a distance of 5.5
metres (outside No.47)

Delete item 393: Lullington Avenue, Hove (outside No.31)

Add new item 397c: Madehurst Close — South side — From a point level with the eastern
boundary of No.14 Madehurst Close eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside
No.16)

Add new item 436a: Milcote Avenue — East side — From a point 54 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Amherst Crescent northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside

No.1l)

Add new item 457a; Nesbitt Road — West side — From a point 76 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Natal Road southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside No.17)

Add new item 486a: Oakdene Crescent — South side- From a point 2.8 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Oakdene Close eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside
No.7)

Delete item 490: Osborne Road, Brighton (outside No.84)

Add new item 510: Portland Avenue — West side — From a point 4.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Mansfield Road southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside
No.8)

Add new item 544: Queensway — North side — From a point 2| metres east of the
boundary wall between 101/103 Queensway eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(outside No.[05)

Add new item 554a: Riley Road ~ West side — From a point 51 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Coombe Road southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside
No.73)

ioc



Add new item 557b: Ringmer Drive — South side — From a point 22 metres west of the
boundary wall between Nos. || & |3 Ringmer Drive westwards for a distance of 5.5
metres (outside Nos. 17/19)

Add new item 569a: Sandgate Road — North side — From a point 22 metres east of the
boundary wall of Nos. 37 & 39 Sandgate Road eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(outside No.49)

Delete item 569b: Sandgate Road, Brighton (outside No.3)

Add new item 580a: Selsfield Drive — West side ~ From a point 78 metres south of the
boundary wall between Nos. 221-232 Selsfield Drive westwards for a distance of 5.5
metres {outside No.25[-255)

Delete item 605: Southover Street, Brighton {outside No.64)

Delete item 605a: Southaver Street, Brighton (opposite No.56)

Add new item 608d: St Andrew’s Road, Brighton — South side — From a point 32 metres
east of the eastern kerbline of Edburton Avenue eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(outside No.12)

Add new item 624a: St Michael's Road — North side — From a point 35 metres east of the

eastern kerbline of Brambledean Road eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside
No.9)

Delete item 627: Stanley Road, Brighton (outside No.49)

Add new item 638: Staplefield Drive — South side ~ From a point 28 metres west of the
boundary wall between Nos. 89 & 91 Staplefield Drive westwards for a distance of 5.5
metres (outside No.97)

Amend item 642 Stapley Road: delete “5.5 metres” and substitute “6.6 metres”
Renumber item 64%9a “Surrenden Holt — South side — From a point 23 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Surreden Road eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (ofs 29)" as
item 64%9b

Add new item 649a: Sullington Close ~ East side — From a point 2.5 metres south of the
southern flank wall of No.| Sullington road southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(outside No.2)

Delete item 650: Surrenden Road, Brighton (outside No.24)

Delete item 651: Surrenden Road, Brighton {outside No.30)

Delete item 65| c: Swanborough Drive, Brighton (outside No.31)

11



Amend item 675 Tivoli Road: delete “75 metres” and substitute “79.5 metres”

Delete item 679: Totland Road, Brighton {outside No.54)

Delete item 700b: Valley Road, Portslade (opposite No.74)

Add new item 700b: Valley Road — West side — From a point 60 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Drove Crescent northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside
No.|35)

Delete item 7!4a: Washington Street, Brighton (outside No.21)

Delete item 740: Wilfrid Road, Hove (outside No.12)

Amend ltem 743 Wilfrid Road: delete “5.5 metres” and substitute 6.6 metres”

Add new item 748a: Withdean Crescent ~ West side — From a point 36 metres north of
the boundary wall between Nos. 3 & 5 Withdean Crescent northwards for a distance of

5.5 metres (outside No.9)

Part 7.1 Solo Motorcycles Parking Bay At Any Time
Renumber existing item 2b Gladstone Place as item2c

Renumber existing item 2¢ Hanover Terrace as item 2d and amend description delete
“westwards for a distance of 3 metres” and substitute “southwards for a distance of 6

metres’

Part 8. Doctors Parking Places At Any Time
Delete item 4: Longridge Avenue, Brighton

Part I 1.l Loading Bay At Any Time
Renumber existing item 7 St Martin's Place as item 8
Add new item 7: 5t Aubyns Road, Portslade — North side — From a peint 22 metres

west of the western lkerbline of Station Road westwards for a distance of 18 metres

Part | |.4 Loading bay Monday to Saturday 8am to 6pm
Delete item 2: Ditchling Road, Brighton

Delete item 3: Ditchling Road, Brighton
Delete item 4: Ditchling Road, Brighton

After Part | 1.8 insert a new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 11.9 Loading Bay Monday to Saturday éam to 6pm

Ref . . Order
No. Road Name | Side Description Date
Ditchlin From a point 17.5 metres south of
! Road g West | the southern kerbline of Hythe Road

northwards for a distance of 15

12



metres

From a point 9 metres north of the
Ditchling Waest northern kerbline of Hythe Road
Road northwards for a distance of | |
metres

From a point [9.5 metres north of
Ditchling East the northern kerbline of Hollingbury
Road Terrace northwards for a distance of
|| metres

Part 15.1 Cycle Lanes
Add new item |0a: Lewes Road — Northwest side — From the junction of Hollingdean

Road to a point {3 metres south of the jumction of Coldean Lane.

Add new item [0b: Lewes Road — Southeast side — From a point 13 metres south of the
junction of Coldean Lane south westwards to the junction of Natal Road.

THE COMMON SEAL OF BRIGHTON & HOVE )
CITY COUNCIL was affixed hereto this 26/ day of )
Qe Two Thousand and )
in the presence of

/ZZ’M% /2?/ on

Authorised Person

13






